Dear Member of the Public
 
I write in reply to your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, our reference number FOI 0031/25.  

I am required by the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to handle all requests in a manner that is blind to the identity of the requestor.  Any information released in response to a request is regarded as being published and therefore in the public domain without caveat.  

For ease of reference, I have listed your questions together with our response below.  You have requested the following information:  

1. Data Protection Officer
a. The name, job title, and contact details of the individual formally designated as DPO for the OPCC.
b. If none exists, all correspondence, agreements, or legal advice evidencing reliance on Hertfordshire Constabulary’s DPO, including any joint controllership arrangements.
c. Any legal advice received on the lawfulness of such reliance.

We note that this is a repeated request for information previously asked. As stated in previous responses information regarding the OPCC’s Data Protection Officer is already publicly available and can be accessed via our website at the following link: Privacy policy. 

[bookmark: _Hlk208829124]2. Training and Competence
a. All training records, certificates, or course outlines for staff responsible for FOI and data protection compliance.
b. The OPCC’s internal policy on mandatory FOI/DPA training for its staff.

Please be advised that the information you have requested is already publicly available and can be accessed via our website at the following link: Publications and Policies. There you will find the Data Protection Policy 2025 which holds the information you are requesting. As the information is accessible by other reasonable means, in accordance with Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, we’re not required to provide it under FOI.
Please be advised that any further information not found within the Data Protection Policy, is not held by the OPCC. 

3. Governance and Audit
a. Any records, minutes, or reports (since Jan 2021) evidencing audits, reviews, or risk assessments of:
· FOI handling by the OPCC;
· GDPR/DPA compliance specific to the OPCC.
b. If no such records exist, confirmation of whether the Commissioner or any Board has ever commissioned such a review.

After conducting reasonable searches at the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner, we can confirm that the information is not held by our office. 


4. Data Controller Status
a. The OPCC’s current entry in the ICO’s Data Protection Register.
b. Any legal advice (internal or external) concerning whether the OPCC is a distinct controller, a joint controller, or otherwise.

After conducting reasonable searches at the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner, we can confirm that this information is not held by our office. 
However, I can advise that the ICO has advised us we do not need to be on the ICO’s Data Protection Register following our application. 

