Dear Member of the Public
 
I write in reply to your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, our reference number FOI 0030/25.  

I am required by the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to handle all requests in a manner that is blind to the identity of the requestor.  Any information released in response to a request is regarded as being published and therefore in the public domain without caveat.  

For ease of reference, I have listed your questions together with our response below.  You have requested the following information:  

A. Oversight and Knowledge
1. All correspondence (internal or external) referencing “Palantir,” “Nectar,” “predictive analytics,” or “AI policing” held by OPCC or Constabulary.
1. Minutes, notes, or briefings (formal or informal) in which these terms were discussed.
1. Any Data Protection Impact Assessments (DPIAs), risk assessments, or training materials provided to, or shared with, the OPCC.

We note that this is a repeated request for information previously asked. As stated in our earlier response, we can confirm that we do not hold the information you have requested. 
Under Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, a public authority is only required to provide information it holds. After conducting reasonable searches, we can confirm that the information is not held by the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner. 

B. Governance Framework
1. Policies or frameworks describing how the OPCC monitors the Constabulary’s use of new technologies.
1. Risk registers, memoranda, or internal papers referencing ethics, public trust, or reputational risk in relation to predictive policing or algorithmic tools.

After conducting reasonable searches at the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner, we can confirm that the information is not held by our office. 

C. Procurement & Contracts
1. Vendor contracts, MOUs, or procurement documents concerning Palantir, Nectar, or similar AI/data platforms.
1. Any correspondence with such vendors referencing the PCC’s involvement, approval, or oversight.

We note that this is also a repeated request for information. 
As mentioned above under section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, a public authority is only required to provide information it holds. After conducting reasonable searches, we can confirm that the information is not held by our office. 

D. Complaints & Engagement
1. Records of complaints, letters, or inquiries from the public, elected officials, journalists, or NGOs about predictive policing or surveillance since 2020.
1. Records of consultation or community engagement about AI, algorithmic, or data-driven policing.

Please be advised that the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

E. Inter-Agency Correspondence
1. Correspondence between the OPCC and the Home Office, NPCC, or College of Policing relating to Palantir, Nectar, or predictive analytics.

Please be advised that the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

