Dear Member of the Public
 
I write in reply to your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, our reference number FOI 0026/25.  

I am required by the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to handle all requests in a manner that is blind to the identity of the requestor.  Any information released in response to a request is regarded as being published and therefore in the public domain without caveat.  

For ease of reference, I have listed your questions together with our response below.  You have requested the following information:  

Hospitality, Gifts, and Declarations
1. Does the Police and Crime Commissioner operate a public register of hospitality and gifts received, akin to the declarations required by Members of Parliament?

Yes, the Police and Crime Commissioner does publish a public register of all gifts & hospitality accepted and declined. 

2. If yes, please provide a copy of the most recent register of hospitality/gifts, covering at least the past three financial years.

I can confirm that the information you have requested is already publicly available on the OPCC website. You can access the published Gifts & Hospitality registers directly via the following link: Finances under the Gifts & Hospitality heading. 
As the information is accessible by other reasonable means, under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, we are not required to provide it in response to an FOI request. 

3. If such a register exists but is not public, please provide the policy governing its use and publication.

No information held.  The register is made public via the OPCC website. 

4. Has the Police and Crime Commissioner accepted any hospitality, gifts, tickets, travel expenses, accommodation, or meals from any private individual, organisation, commercial entity, or lobbying group since January 2020?

All information regarding the Police and Crime Commissioner’s accepted or declined Gifts & Hospitality has been published at the link provided above. Therefore, as this information is accessible by other means, under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, we are not required to provide it in response to an FOI request. 

5. For each instance identified in Q4, please provide:
o Date of acceptance
o Description of hospitality or gift
o Estimated or declared value
o Source or host
o Whether it was declared, and if so, when
o Any related documentation or internal correspondence

As mentioned above, all information regarding the Police and Crime Commissioner’s accepted and declined Gifts & Hospitality can be found under the Gifts & Hospitality heading at the above link to the OPCC website. 
If you are seeking any related documentation or internal correspondence beyond the published register, please could you clarify or refine your request to help us identify the specific information you are interested in. 

Hospitality System, Oversight, and Recording
1. Does the Office of the PCC operate any internal or electronic system for logging or approving hospitality, sponsorships, or third-party benefits offered to the PCC or staff?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Who is responsible for oversight and compliance of this hospitality logging system?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Is this register or log reviewed by any independent body, committee, or ethics officer?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Has the PCC ever failed to declare a gift or hospitality benefit which was later logged or retrospectively disclosed? If so, please provide details.

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information.
1. Are declarations cross-referenced with diary entries, emails, or meeting attendance for verification?

I can confirm that declarations are cross-referenced with diary entries, emails and meeting attendance for verification. 

Engagement with “Nectar” or Associated Entities
1. Has the Police and Crime Commissioner attended any product launches, demonstrations, or promotional events relating to a product, platform, or service known as “Nectar”?
1. If so, please provide:
· Date(s) of attendance
· Location or format of the event (e.g., in person, virtual, hybrid)
· Name of host organisation or vendor
· Subject matter or scope of the product
· Whether any gifts, hospitality, or promotional items were received
1. Has the PCC or OPCC entered into any correspondence, briefing, meeting, or informal discussion with a representative of Nectar or its affiliated partners since January 2021?

Please note that this is a repeat of a previous Freedom of Information request which has already been responded to. Under Section 14(2) of the Act, a public authority is not obliged to comply with a request that is identical or substantially similar to one previously received. However, I will confirm once again, that the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

Governance, Transparency, and Related Interests
1. Has the PCC declared any interests or prior associations with companies, consultancies, or individuals involved in the provision of crime-prevention or data analytics tools (including Nectar)?
1. Are declarations of interests reviewed and updated on a scheduled basis? If so, what is the frequency and oversight mechanism?

I can confirm that the OPCC publish the Police and Crime Commissioner’s disclosable interests on the OPCC website at the following link: Disclosable Interests. This is reviewed and updated every year. Therefore, as this information is reasonably accessible by other means, under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, we are not required to provide it in response to and FOI request. 

1. Has the PCC, Deputy PCC, or any senior OPCC staff received training, marketing materials, trial access, or prototype demonstrations relating to Nectar or a similar data platform?
1. Please provide any briefing notes, attendance records, or email invitations related to Nectar demos, pilots, or events.

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

External Funding and Influence
1. Has any Nectar-related project or promotional engagement been funded or co-hosted by an external supplier, corporate sponsor, or government innovation fund?
1. Are there any Memoranda of Understanding (MOUs), Non-Disclosure Agreements (NDAs), or partnership agreements between the OPCC and any company or entity associated with Nectar?
1. Has the PCC made any public statement, interview, media comment, or published opinion regarding the use, testing, endorsement, or strategic value of the Nectar platform? If so, please provide a transcript or recording.

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

