Dear Member of the Public
 
I write in reply to your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, our reference number FOI 0023/25.  

I am required by the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to handle all requests in a manner that is blind to the identity of the requestor.  Any information released in response to a request is regarded as being published and therefore in the public domain without caveat.  

For ease of reference, I have listed your questions together with our response below.  You have requested the following information:  

A. Institutional Ignorance or Intentional Design?
1. Was a decision ever made—formally or informally—not to be briefed about Palantir or Nectar?
1. Are there internal policies that limit what information reaches the PCC about data initiatives?
1. Has the PCC issued any directive instructing staff not to retain minutes or records relating to predictive policing technology?
1. Are there “off the record” channels of communication between the Constabulary and the OPCC?
1. Have any OPCC staff ever verbally acknowledged knowledge of the Nectar project but declined to document it?

Please be advised that we have already responded to these questions in response to a previous FOI request submitted on the 24th June that this office responded to on the 22nd July. 

B. Absence of Information – Coincidence or Cultivated Ignorance?
1. Has any member of the OPCC staff ever attended a meeting (even informally) where Palantir, predictive analytics, or algorithmic policing were discussed?
1. Have any senior police officers ever mentioned Palantir or Nectar in PCC briefings without follow-up or documentation?
1. Were briefing materials ever presented and then returned, unrecorded, to avoid disclosure obligations?
1. Has your office ever relied on “informal briefings” to sidestep recordkeeping obligations?
1. Have there been any internal discussions about not creating disclosable records?

As above, we have already responded to these questions in response to a previous FOI request, to confirm, the OPCC does not hold this information. 

C. Institutional Responsibility and Oversight Gaps
1. If your office has never inquired into Palantir or Nectar, why not?

I can confirm that the information you have requested is not a request for recorded information. Under Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA), public authorities are not required to create new information in order to respond to a request. The FOIA provides access to recorded information held at the time of the request rather than generation of new content.

1. What mechanisms exist to flag emerging technologies or privacy-infringing practices to the PCC?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. What oversight does the PCC provide over algorithmic tools or partnerships involving third-party vendors?
1. Has your office ever reviewed a Data Protection Impact Assessment for a technology used by Hertfordshire Police?
1. If not for Nectar, what example can you provide where the OPCC has intervened in a policing tech rollout?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information as this is not the role of the OPCC. Hertfordshire Constabulary will have an Information Assurance and Information Governance team for this. Therefore, you may wish to refer your request to Hertfordshire Constabulary who may hold information relevant to your request, which you can do at the following link if you wish to do so: Make an FOI request to ask for information about the police | Hertfordshire Constabulary

D. Staff and Structural Disclosure Failures
1. Have any current or former staff members raised concerns—formally or informally—about predictive policing or third-party data access?
1. Has the OPCC ever commissioned training on AI governance, data ethics, or algorithmic transparency?
1. Are any OPCC staff seconded to or embedded with Hertfordshire Constabulary's digital innovation or data units?
1. Do any OPCC job descriptions mention surveillance technology, oversight of data, or public interest assessments?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. What vetting process does your office use to assess vendor integrity when new technologies are proposed?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information as this is not the role of the OPCC. Hertfordshire Constabulary would have their own Procurement department who would do this. Therefore, you may also wish to refer your request to Hertfordshire Constabulary who may hold the information you are requesting. 

E. Digital Trace and Silent Engagement
1. Have any Palantir-related domains, documents, or press materials been opened, downloaded, or circulated internally within the OPCC network?
1. Have there been search queries or document downloads on Nectar, Palantir, or predictive analytics from your office’s official IP address?
1. Have staff devices, accounts, or internal drives ever logged the term “Palantir,” “Nectar,” “predictive policing,” “AI risk,” or “data surveillance”?
1. Have any FOI requests from other parties (journalists, NGOs) mentioning Palantir passed through your office in the last 3 years?
1. Was any press coverage of Palantir ever flagged internally or passed to the PCC?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any information on the above requests. 

F. Political, Public and Civil Engagements (or Lack Thereof)
1. Have any elected officials ever attempted to raise questions with the PCC about Nectar, predictive analytics, or Palantir?
1. Has the OPCC ever received written concerns from members of the public about mass surveillance or algorithmic policing?
1. Has the OPCC ever considered seeking public consultation or engagement prior to the deployment of data-intensive tools?
1. Has the OPCC ever briefed the Police and Crime Panel about its understanding or position on predictive analytics?
1. Has the PCC ever spoken on record about the ethical boundaries of AI and policing?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any information on the above requests. 

G. Legal Risk and Liability Awareness
1. Is there any internal policy defining how the OPCC handles data protection risks arising from third-party partnerships?
1. Has legal advice ever been sought about the potential liability of the PCC in the event of unlawful data processing by the police?
1. Has the OPCC ever reviewed any vendor contract between the police and a third-party data provider?
1. If the PCC’s name appears in any Nectar-related DPIA, contract, or assessment, has your office ensured the data subject rights implications are understood?
1. Has your office sought indemnity or legal clarity about the PCC’s potential exposure in case of a GDPR breach involving Palantir?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any information in relation to the above requests. 

H. Conscious Avoidance, Cultural Complicity, and the Limits of Plausible Deniability
1. Do any internal PCC risk registers include references to AI, public-private data sharing, or digital policing?
1. Has the OPCC adopted any principles, frameworks, or ethical standards governing its interaction with algorithmic or surveillance technologies?
1. Has the OPCC ever evaluated the human rights implications of deploying AI to predict crime?
1. Have you conducted any benchmarking or peer reviews with other PCCs on the governance of predictive systems?
1. Has any internal communication acknowledged reputational risk to the PCC if Palantir’s involvement were to become controversial?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any information in relation to the above requests. 

