Dear Member of the Public
 
I write in reply to your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, our reference number FOI 0022/25.  

I am required by the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to handle all requests in a manner that is blind to the identity of the requestor.  Any information released in response to a request is regarded as being published and therefore in the public domain without caveat.  

For ease of reference, I have listed your questions together with our response below.  You have requested the following information:  

1. Copies of all Memoranda of Understanding, Data Sharing Agreements, or governance frameworks that permit PSD officers from Bedfordshire, Cambridgeshire or any other force to access:
0. Hertfordshire internal complaints
0. BWV footage or evidence systems
0. Personnel records or misconduct files

Following your request searches were conducted at the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner for Hertfordshire for the above information. These searches failed to locate any records/documents relevant to your request. Accordingly, I have determined that Herts OPCC does not hold the information you have requested. However, I do believe the information you are requesting may be held by the Constabulary and would advise requesting the information from them, which you can do at the following link if you wish to do so: Make an FOI request to ask for information about the police | Hertfordshire Constabulary

1. All Data Protection Impact Assessments (DPIAs) and internal risk assessments conducted in relation to:
1. Cross-force access to Athena or other tri-force systems
1. Shared BWV and evidence-handling responsibilities
1. Access by third-party PSD officers

Searches have been conducted at our office for DPIA’s and internal risk assessments in relation to your above 3 points. Again, these searches failed to locate any records/documents relevant to your request. Therefore, I have also determined that Herts OPCC does not hold this information. However, like above, I believe Hertfordshire Constabulary may hold some information relevant to your request and again would advise directing your request to them. 

1. A list of complaints made since 1 January 2020 to your office concerning:
2. BWV evidence being missing, redacted, or corrupted
2. Collusion, interference or retaliation by PSD officers from other forces
2. Lack of accountability in cross-force investigations

Searches were again conducted at the OPCC for complaints made since 1st January 2020 concerning your three above points. These searches failed to locate any records/documents relevant to your request. Under the Freedom of Information Act, public authorities are not required to create new information in order to respond to a request. Our obligation is to provide recorded information that is held at the time of the request. You may wish to divert your request to the Constabulary who may hold some of the requested information. 
In relation to ‘Lack of accountability in cross-force investigations’ I would like to inform you that the OPCC Complaint Resolution Team (the team dedicated to managing and resolving complaints made about Hertfordshire police), do not carry out investigations, especially cross-force investigations. Therefore, I would like to signpost you again to Hertfordshire Constabulary who I believe would be better placed to answer your request. 

1. A record of any settlements, legal payouts, compensation agreements or NDAs relating to:
3. Complaints or civil claims involving BWV
3. Failures in complaint handling
3. Misuse or mismanagement of shared digital infrastructure

After careful consideration, I can confirm that the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner for Hertfordshire does not hold the information you have requested. This information is likely to be held by the Hertfordshire Constabulary, who are the appropriate authority for operational policing matters. I would recommend that you direct your request to Hertfordshire Constabulary’s Freedom of Information team.

1. The most recent organisational chart of your office showing:
4. The structure of your Complaint Resolution Team
4. The named Data Protection Officer
4. Staff responsible for oversight of BWV and data sharing
4. Points of liaison with Bedfordshire and Cambridgeshire counterparts

Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 exempts public authorities from providing information that is already reasonably accessible to the requestor, whether through our own publications or by other means. This exemption applies even if the requestor is unaware of where the information is located, as long as it is available to them by other reasonable means. In such cases we are not required to provide the information again but will, where appropriate, direct the requestor to the source where the information can be accessed. Therefore, the OPCC’s organisational chart can be found on the OPCC website at the following link: Organisational Chart. 

In relation to the structure of the Complaint Resolution Team (CRT) I can advise that they are made up of one Complaints Team and Service Improvement Manager, alongside three Complaint Resolution Team Leaders, and five Complaint Resolution Team Case Handlers. 

If information you are seeking on our organisational chart is not available on our website, this means we do not hold it in recorded form. 

