Dear Member of the Public
 
I write in reply to your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, our reference number FOI 0020/25.  

I am required by the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to handle all requests in a manner that is blind to the identity of the requestor.  Any information released in response to a request is regarded as being published and therefore in the public domain without caveat.  

For ease of reference, I have listed your questions together with our response below.  You have requested the following information:  

1. What formal mechanisms does the OPCC have in place to scrutinise PSD (Professional Standards Department) activity when it is conducted by another force on Hertfordshire territory or affecting Hertfordshire personnel or residents?

Please be advised that the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any information on this subject.  

1. Please provide any meeting minutes, emails, or briefing notes where concerns were raised by OPCC staff regarding BWV access, deletion, or evidential handling by another force’s officers.

Please be advised that the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information.  Our office only deals with complaints about the Police and not concerns which may be raised regarding the access of other forces to BWV.

1. Has the Commissioner or any senior OPCC staff ever challenged or formally queried the legality or proportionality of data access by Bedfordshire or Cambridgeshire officers under tri-force sharing schemes? If so, provide correspondence or notes.

Please be advised that the office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information.  You may wish to refer your request to Hertfordshire Constabulary who may hold information relevant to your request.  You can do this at the following link if you wish to do so: Make an FOI request to ask for information about the police | Hertfordshire Constabulary

1. Provide all internal guidance, policies, or checklists used by OPCC complaint handlers when reviewing cases involving BWV.

Please see the attached document entitled ‘BWV Database crib sheet’ which is the internal guidance given to complaint handlers advising how to record BWV or its absence when dealing with complaints from members of the public. 

1. How many cases since 2020 were escalated by OPCC staff due to concerns over data unavailability, officer conduct, or BWV irregularities?

Please be advised that the office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any information on this subject. 

1. Has the OPCC ever sought legal advice regarding the sufficiency of data sharing agreements between Hertfordshire and its tri-force partners? If so, provide the dates and topics of those instructions.

Please be advised that the office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any information on this subject. 

1. Please provide a list of every audit or review carried out by the OPCC regarding cross-border access to Athena, BWV footage, or complaint databases since 2019.

Please be advised that the office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any information on this subject. 

1. What controls exist to prevent or monitor unauthorised access to Hertfordshire complaints by officers employed in other forces’ PSD units?

Please be advised that the office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. Therefore, you may wish to refer your request to the Constabulary who may hold information relevant to your request, which you can do at the following link if you wish to do so: Make an FOI request to ask for information about the police | Hertfordshire Constabulary

1. Has any OPCC officer flagged a data protection concern internally since 2020 relating to external force access to Hertfordshire records? Provide redacted versions of the concerns raised.

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Has the OPCC ever declined to sign or delayed agreement to a data sharing or tri-force governance document due to legal or operational concerns?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information.

1. Please confirm the number of complaints received by the OPCC since 2020 that were initially assessed as ‘low-level’ but were later escalated due to evidence conflicts or cross-force involvement.

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Provide internal communications (emails, memos) regarding whether BWV evidence is consistently obtained and retained before OPCC reviews misconduct complaints.

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any information on this subject. 

1. [bookmark: _Hlk206067872]Has the OPCC conducted any risk assessment regarding reputational harm, legal liability, or public confidence relating to data loss, BWV tampering, or complaint mishandling?

Please be advised that the office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. You may wish to refer your request to the Constabulary who may hold information relevant to your request. You can do this at the following link if you wish to do so: Make an FOI request to ask for information about the police | Hertfordshire Constabulary

1. What thresholds or triage mechanisms are used by your Complaint Resolution Team to decide whether BWV footage should be reviewed, requested, or escalated?

BWV will be searched for and viewed (if available) for any complaint received that can be resolved by viewing the actions of officers at the scene by the Complaint Resolution Team (CRT).  Where there is no requirement to view BWV, such as when lack of contact from an officer is raised as a concern, CRT would not access the BWV system as it is not required to resolve the complaint. 

1. Does the OPCC maintain a log or audit trail of who within the office accesses BWV, complaint records, or internal police data?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Provide any policies, procedures, or protocols that govern how OPCC staff engage with BWV — including training documents or data handling instructions.

This request is similar to request number 4. Please refer to that response. 

1. What proactive oversight does the OPCC undertake to ensure that shared custody suite operations meet minimum standards on detainee rights, BWV integrity, and complaints accessibility?

The Commissioner is not responsible for the day to day operation of the custody suites, however, the office of the Police and Crime Commissioner operates an Independent Custody Visiting scheme following the Home Office Code of Practice on Independent Custody Visting published in March 2013.  This can be found on the Home Office website and relates specifically to the welfare of detainees in police custody: https://assets.publishing.service.gov.uk/media/5a7cd2b740f0b65b3de0b622/Independent_custody_visitors_code_of_practice.pdf. 

1. Have any incidents been reported to the Commissioner involving alleged cross-force conflicts of interest in the handling of misconduct complaints or PSD investigations?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Provide copies of any internal review, internal audit, or external consultancy work commissioned by the OPCC to assess the adequacy of its FOI and complaint-handling practices.

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Has the OPCC ever issued a warning, formal challenge, or written representation to Hertfordshire Constabulary over information withheld from the OPCC during a complaint or oversight process?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Provide a breakdown of all OPCC staff who have received training on FOI law, data protection, complaint handling, and cross-force operational integrity in the past three years (job title and date).

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information.

1. How many OPCC staff currently have system-level access to Athena, BWV libraries, or complaint registers maintained by Hertfordshire Constabulary?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Have any data incidents, unauthorised access reports, or ICO reportable breaches occurred within the OPCC since January 2020? If so, provide dates and nature.

No ICO breaches have been recorded in the OPCC since January 2020.  

1. Provide the total number of times the OPCC has formally asked Hertfordshire Constabulary to retrieve BWV on behalf of a complainant or due to a concern raised during oversight.

The office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information, as we do not ask Hertfordshire Constabulary for BWV. If a complainant requests BWV, they are signposted to the appropriate department within the Constabulary. 

1. What arrangements exist between Hertfordshire OPCC and the IOPC to jointly manage, refer or escalate complaints that involve multiple forces, data anomalies, or BWV concerns?

The office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold any information on this subject.  The office does not jointly manage any complaints with the IOPC.  If a complaint needs to be transferred to IOPC, it will be referred to the PSD in the first instance, as per the statutory guidance on complaints. 

1. Provide a summary of any correspondence with Bedfordshire or Cambridgeshire OPCCs relating to complaints, BWV evidence, data integrity, or PSD conduct between 2020 and present.

I can confirm that the information you have requested does not exist in a written summary format. Under Section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA), public authorities are not required to create new information in order to respond to a request. The FOIA provides access to recorded information held at the time of the request rather than generation of new content. 

1. Has the OPCC ever received or reviewed any whistleblowing reports related to misconduct complaints, BWV tampering, or PSD access across tri-force systems?

The Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. What documented assurances or contractual guarantees has the OPCC received confirming that shared digital policing platforms (e.g., Athena) meet data protection and security standards?

Bedfordshire, Cambridgeshire & Hertfordshire (BCH) OPCCs all share the same ICT network and systems and follow the same protocols, data protection and security standards. All staff are appropriately vetted and annually sign the BCH system operating procedures (SyOps).  System and data access is granted as per role-based access and staff complete the same mandated data protection training as all other BCH police officers and staff.    

1. Has the OPCC carried out any internal simulation, audit, or test case to verify what happens when a complaint involves officers from multiple forces and shared infrastructure (e.g., BWV from Herts but custody in Beds)?

The office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 

1. Provide copies of any action plans, performance reviews, or KPI dashboards used by the OPCC to track how effectively complaints involving BWV or PSD are handled across force boundaries.

The office of the Police and Crime Commissioner does not hold this information. 


